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7.1.9: Sensitization of students and employees of the Institution to the constitutional

obligations: values, rights, duties and responsibilities of citizens:

          

           Gargaon College promotes the secular, democratic and inclusive values

enshrined in our constitution. Students are encouraged to exercise their fundamental

freedoms with a clear understanding of duties too. The college promotes quality

education with utilization of full human potential towards building equitable and

responsible individuals of a strong nation. The faculties, students, and employees of

the institution are familiar with the strong proponents of constitutional values and

responsibilities. The institute takes pride to possess human resources familiar with

human values and rights and carrying their duties as responsible citizens. Keeping

these in mind, our institute regularly observed national days and events that help

remind the faculties, students, and employees about their constitutional obligations

and responsibilities. The different programmes organized by the institute make

participants aware of human values, rights, duties, and responsibilities. The institute

regularly organizes seminars, extension lectures, group discussions, project work, and

formal and informal gatherings to keep students, employees, and all concerned glued

to their constitutional responsibilities and advocate for this in all walks of life. Also,

various courses on Environment studies are there in the curriculum which gives them

insight into environment acts, wildlife protection act, forest act, global environmental

concerns etc. Further, different programmes and initiatives towards environmental

protection are regularly arranged to aware the people of the institution.
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      Gargaon College organized different lectures, events on ethics, values, duties, and
responsibilities and on saving the environment. Various programmes that were
organised during last five years are-

Programmes organized at college to remind the faculties and students about their
constitutional obligations, values and responsibilities: 

Sl. No. Year Report Link

1. 2023-24

2. 2022-23

3. 2021-22

4. 2020-21

5. 2019-20

https://gargaoncollege.ac.in/pdf/iqac/aqar-data/ssr/7-1-9%2823-24%29.pdf
https://gargaoncollege.ac.in/pdf/iqac/aqar-data/ssr/7-1-9%282022-23%29.pdf
https://gargaoncollege.ac.in/pdf/iqac/aqar-data/ssr/7-1-9%2821-22%29.pdf
https://gargaoncollege.ac.in/pdf/iqac/aqar-data/ssr/7-1-9%282019-20%29.pdf
https://gargaoncollege.ac.in/pdf/iqac/aqar-data/ssr/7-1-9%282020-21%29.pdf


Sl. No. Syllabus related to Link

1. Human Values

2. Professional Ethics

3. Human Rights and Equality

4. Gender Equality

Various courses and papers to remind the faculties and students about their
constitutional obligations, values and responsibilities- 

         The course curriculum of our affiliating University is framed with different
courses like professional ethics, human values, human rights and duties, equality etc.
as a small step to inculcate constitutional obligations among the students. 

https://gargaoncollege.ac.in/pdf/iqac/aqar-data/ssr/Course%20code%20human%20values.pdf
https://gargaoncollege.ac.in/pdf/iqac/aqar-data/ssr/COURSE%20CODE%20pro%20ethics.pdf
https://gargaoncollege.ac.in/pdf/iqac/aqar-data/ssr/syllabus.pdf
https://gargaoncollege.ac.in/pdf/iqac/aqar-data/ssr/COURSE%20CODE%20gender.pdf


Code of Conduct established in our Institution

Link of the Report

Policy for Differently-Abled for a Barrier-free and Inclusive Campus 

Link of the Report

            Our institute establishes policies that reflect core values. Code of conduct is
prepared for students, teaching and non-teaching staff of the college and everyone
should obey the conduct rules.

     Gargaon College is committed towards enabling a barrier free environment,
disabled friendly campus and promoting inclusive education that provides the needs
of all children. Our institute implemented several policies to avoid discrimination,
exploitation and exclusion of disabled students and staff from all spheres of work and
education and to provide them the equal opportunities for development. The detail of
the scheme is linked below-

https://gargaoncollege.ac.in/pdf/iqac/aqar-data/2023-24/Code%20of%20Conduct%20.pdf
https://gargaoncollege.ac.in/pdf/iqac/aqar-data/2023-24/Divyanjan_final%20report.pdf


Promotion of Gender Equality

Link of the Report

Gargaon College is dedicated to advancing gender equality and awareness through
both its academic programs and extracurricular offerings, creating a welcoming and
supportive atmosphere for every student. By embedding gender considerations into its
curriculum, the college actively challenges stereotypes and biases, striving for a
balanced representation of all genders in various fields of study. This strategy is
designed to cultivate a deep sense of equality and mutual respect among students,
inspiring them to thoughtfully address and engage with gender issues.

https://gargaoncollege.ac.in/pdf/iqac/ssr/Gender%20equality.pdf


Sl. No. Programme
Report
Link

1. Workshop on Recycling Plastic & Electronics

2. Clean India Campaign

3. Cleanliness Drive

4. Iconic Week Celebration

5.
Seven Day Special Camp at Longkak Gohain

Gaon

6. A Swachh Bharat Mission Urban Initiative 

7. Pollution Control Day

The students are inspired by participating in various programs and our institute
conducted awareness programs on the ban on plastics, recycling plastic, cleanliness,
Swachh Bharat, etc. involving students.

Programmes organized at college to remind the faculties and students about 
their responsibilities towards environment: 

https://gargaoncollege.ac.in/pdf/iqac/aqar-data/2023-24/RECYCLING%20%20PLASTICS%20AND%20ELECTRONICS.pdf
https://gargaoncollege.ac.in/pdf/iqac/aqar-data/2022-23/Clean%20India%20Campaign_22-23.pdf
https://gargaoncollege.ac.in/pdf/iqac/aqar-data/2022-23/Cleanliness%20drive_22-23.pdf
https://gargaoncollege.ac.in/pdf/iqac/aqar-data/2022-23/Iconic%20Week_22-23.pdf
https://gargaoncollege.ac.in/pdf/iqac/aqar-data/2022-23/Iconic%20Week_22-23.pdf
https://gargaoncollege.ac.in/pdf/iqac/aqar-data/2022-23/Swach%20Bharat%20Urban%20Iniatiative_22-23.pdf
https://gargaoncollege.ac.in/pdf/iqac/aqar-data/2022-23/NATIONAL%20POLLUTION%20CONTROL%20DAY%2C%20%202022-2023.pdf


Various courses and papers to remind the faculties and students about their
responsibilities towards Environmental protection- 

Syllabus Report Link

Environment Related

Environmental protection related

Initiatives and programmes Report Link

Green Campus Initiatives 

Initiatives of the College to make campus Clean and Green: 

https://gargaoncollege.ac.in/pdf/iqac/aqar-data/ssr/COURSE%20CODE%20Envn.pdf
https://gargaoncollege.ac.in/pdf/iqac/aqar-data/2023-24/_Green%20campus%20initiatives%2023-24%20%281%29.pdf
https://gargaoncollege.ac.in/pdf/iqac/ssr/Environment%20syllabus.pdf



